

**SLIGO CREEK ELEMENTARY SCHOOL  
PLAYGROUND RENOVATION**

<b>BIDDERS</b>	<b>CFI CONSTRUCTION CORP.</b>	<b>DUBOIS CONSTRUCTION, INC.</b>	<b>HENLEY CONSTRUCTION COMPANY, INC.</b>	<b>KELLER BROTHERS, INC.</b>	<b>WILLIAM F. KLINGENSMITH, INC.</b>	<b>MAGGIN CONSTRUCTION</b>	<b>MCN BUILD</b>	<b>PLANO-COUDON, LLC</b>	<b>WKM SOLUTIONS, LLC</b>
<b>BASE BID</b>	<b>\$683,000.00</b>	<b>no bid</b>	<b>no bid</b>	<b>\$549,000.00</b>	<b>\$667,000.00</b>	<b>no bid</b>	<b>no bid</b>	<b>no bid</b>	<b>\$727,423.65</b>
Add Alt 1 - Flexi-Pave P2000 (standard color)	<b>\$38,000.00</b>			<b>\$26,600.00</b>	<b>\$41,000.00</b>				<b>\$87,591.60</b>
Add Alt 2 - Surface America Playbound (standard color)	<b>\$23,000.00</b>			<b>\$21,600.00</b>	<b>\$28,000.00</b>				<b>\$108,000.00</b>
Add Alt 3 -temporary sodding	<b>\$9,000.00</b>			<b>\$7,900.00</b>	<b>\$9,000.00</b>				<b>\$24,000.00</b>
Add Alt 4 - Flex-pave pervious pavement	<b>\$50,000.00</b>			<b>\$73,000.00</b>	<b>\$20,000.00</b>				<b>\$140,400.00</b>
Add Alt 5 - provide screening trees	<b>\$9,000.00</b>			<b>\$7,400.00</b>	<b>\$8,000.00</b>				<b>\$8,400.00</b>
<b>MBE Forms A &amp; B</b>									
<b>Bid Bond Included</b>	<b>X</b>			<b>X</b>	<b>X</b>				<b>X</b>
<b>Addendum 1</b>	<b>X</b>			<b>X</b>	<b>X</b>				<b>X</b>